ITB 250705

GASOLINE & DIESEL FUELS
CONSOLIDATED ROAD & BRIDGE
BID SUMMARY
ITEM 1 ITEM 2 ITEM 3 ITEM 4
Off Road: Diesel: Unleaded: Pick-up Off Road:
Vendor Source Mark-up Per Mark-up Per Mark-up Per Mark-up Per
Gallon Gallon Gallon Gallon for
Delivered Delivered Delivered County Pick-up
0.15 0.15 0.15 NO BID
. . Davidson 0Oil
Davidson 0il Co Co 250 USG 250 USG 250 USG
Order Order Order NO BID
Minimum Minimum Minimum
0.2641 0.2641 0.4339 NO BID
Gold Star LUb.bOCk
Petroleum, Inc TReﬁr?er}l, 400 USG 400 USG 400 USG
erminals Order Order Order NO BID
Minimum Minimum Minimum
Greshan Petroleum 0.3000 0.3000 0.3000 0.3000
Company Phillips 66
250 USG 250 USG 250 USG 250 USG
Order Order Order Order
Minimum Minimum Minimum Minimum
+0.2503 +0.2544 +0.5433 NO BID
Pinnacle Pro Petroleum
Petroleum, Inc. Lubbock TX 500 USG 500 USG 500 USG
Order Order Order NO BID
Minimum Minimum Minimum
No Response | No Response | No Response | No Response
The Diesel Cleaner, N/A
LLC
No Response
] ] 0.102 0.107 0.11 .08
Walker Sims QOil Phillips 66
Company, Inc.
No Minimum Order

Multi-award to: Walker Sims Oil Company, Inc. and Davidson 0il, Co




