
ITB 170903 

Aggregate Road Materials, Grade 3, 4 and 5 

Or Alternate 

OPR: Public Works 
                                       

   

Bidder Grade 3 delivered Grade 3 picked up Grade 4 delivered Grade 4 picked up Grade 5 delivered Grade 5 picked up 

Volcanic Stone $0.21 $24.00 $0.21 $24.00 $0.21 $26.00 

R.E. Janes No bid No bid No bid No Bid No bid $9.75 

West Texas 

Paving 
$0.18 $24.00 $0.18 $27.00 $0.18 $24.00 

Fisher Sand & 

Gravel 
No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

West Industries No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid No bid 

 

 

Bidder Alternate 

Volcanic Stone No Alternate 

R.E. Janes 
ASTM C-33 Size 7(similar to grade 4) $15.00/ton 

1962 TxDOT Grade 4 $11.55/ton 

West Texas Paving No Alternate 

Fisher Sand & Gravel 

Grade 3 alternate $24.00/ton plus $0.20/mile delivered 

Grade 4 alternate $32.50/ton plus $0.20/mile delivered 

Grade 5 alternate $26.00/ton plus $0.20/mile delivered 

Gradations submitted for all 3 grades 

West Industries 
Grade 3 $28.00/ton; $22.50/ton buyer pick up 

Grade 4 $28.00/ton; $22.50/ton buyer pick up 

 

*Multi Award 

*Annual Pricing 10/1/2017-9/30/2018 


