ABERNATHY
ITB 220203
BID SUMMARY
VOLUNTEER FIRE DEPARTMENT
PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT

LUBBOCK COUNTY
Vendor
Item Description Quantity Metro Fire
Daco Fire Equipment [];:Iea'F Safet{ Apparatus SanitizeNow Inc.
quipmen Specialists Inc

Helmet for Structural .

1 | Girefighting 30 EA $454.00 No Bid $550.00 $341.00

2 | Bullard Wildland Helmet 30 EA $49.96 No Bid $58.00 $91.60

3 Particulate Hood 30 EA $84.00 No Bid $120.00 $117.00
Lightweight Structural .

4 | Binker Boots SR $360.00 No Bid $385.00 $487.00

5 Lion Commander Ace Gloves | 30 PAIR $99.00 No Bid No Bid $130.82

6 Custom Turnout Coat 30 EA $2,124.00 No Bid No Bid $1,300.90

7 | pustom Turnouttligh-Back | - 50 gp $1,397.00 No Bid No Bid $1,003.75

8 Custom Turnout Belted Pant 30 EA $1,409.00 No Bid No Bid $698.00
Lightweight Dual-Certified . .

9 VersaPro PLUS Coat 30 EA $443.00 No Bid No Bid $451.49
Lightweight Dual Certified . .

10 VersaPro PLUS Pant 30 EA $394.00 No Bid No Bid $577.45
Merchflex Xtreme

11 | Extrication Non-Structural 30 PAIR $38.00 No Bid No Bid $43.58
Protective Gloves
Team Wendy SAR . .

12 Backcountry Helmet 30 EA $208.00 No Bid No Bid $201.50
Team Wendy SAR . .

13 Backcountry Helmet Visor 30EA $58.00 No Bid No Bid $65.26
3M Scott SCBA Facepiece

14 Mask (Model: AV-3000 HT) 30 EA $ 250.00 $296.22 $301.00 $453.00
3M Scott AV-632 Bayonet

15 Adapter 150 EA $88.00 $46.30 $65.00 $85.11
3M Combination

16 | Cartridge/Filter, Organic 100 EA No Bid $3.1604 $23.00 $70.34
Vapor/P100

Daco Fire Equipment: Items #14, #15 - Does not meet brand name or equal.

SanitizeNow, Inc.: Items #6, #7, #8, 12— Does not meet brand name or equal and/or specifications.

Daco Fire Equipment will be awarded Items 1 through 13

Heat Safety Equipment will be awarded Items 14 through 16




