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ITB 250703 
ASPHALT MATERIALS – ROAD & BRIDGE DEPARTMENT 

 
BID SUMMARY 

 

Vendors Ergon Asphalt Emulsions P2 Emulsions 
 (A) 

Price Per 
Gallon 

(B) 
Del. Charge Per 

Gallon 

(A+B) 
Total Price Per 

Gallon 

(A) 
Price Per 

Gallon 

(B) 
Del. Charge Per 

Gallon 

(A+B) 
Total Price Per 

Gallon 

CHFRS-2P $2.50 $0.19 $2.69 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

CRS-2P $2.85 $0.19 $3.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

CMS-2P $2.85 $0.19 $3.04 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

CSS-1H TACK OIL $2.50 $0.19 $2.69 *$2.69 Add $0.27/Gal $2.96 

CSS-1H TACK OIL 1:1 $1.40 $0.19 $1.59 *$2.69 Add $0.27/Gal $2.96 

FastSet Fog Seal 60/40 
Dilute NO BID NO BID NO BID *$2.83 Add $0.27/Gal $3.10 

AE-P $3.70 $0.19 $3.89 *$1.93 Add $0.27/Gal $2.20 

AE-P 50/50 $2.10 $0.19 $2.29 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 
*CSS-1H Tack Oil alternate P2 S1, 
*CSS-1H Tack Oil 1:1 alternate P2 S1, 
*AE-P alternate P2 RTU 
*FastSet Fog Seal 60/40 Dilute alternate P2 ROC 
 
Multi-award to: Ergon Asphalt Emulsions and P2 Emulsions 


