
ITB 180904 

Aggregate Road Materials Grade 3, 4, and 5,  

Or Alternate 

OPR: Public Works                                       

   

Bidder 
Grade 3 

Material/per 

Ton 

Grade 3 

Delivered/per 

Mile 

Grade 4 

Material/per 

Ton 

Grade 4 

Delivered/per 

Mile 

Grade 5 

Material/per 

Ton 

Grade 5 

Delivered/per 

Mile 

Grade 4-PB 

Material/per 

Ton 

Grade 4-PB 

Delivered/per 

Mile 

 

Green Dream 

International LLC 

$27.23 $0.40 $17.88 $0.40 $17.88 

 

$0.40 

 

 

$17.88 $0.40 

 

MUDco Ready Mix, 

LLC 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.30 

 

$4.00 

 

No Bid No Bid 

 

R.E. Janes Gravel 

Co 

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.30 

  

 No Bid 

 

No Bid No Bid 

 

 

Bidder Alternate 

 

Green Dream International LLC 

 

No Alternate 

MUDco Ready Mix, LLC 

1. ASTM C-33, Size No. 7, Material $16.22/Ton, 

$4.00/Mile Delivered 

2. 1962 TxDOT Grade 4, Material $12.62/Ton, 

$4.00/Mile Delivered 

R.E. Janes Gravel Co 
1. ASTM C-33, Size No. 7, Material $16.22/Ton,  

1962 TxDOT Grade 4, Material $12.62/Ton 

* Multi Award 

* Annual Pricing 10/22/2018/-09/30/2019 


