
ITB 210203 Summary 
Sheriff’s Office Uniforms 

Armor Package  

Item Item Description 
Diexon 

Group, LLC 

G T 
Distributors, 

Inc. 
Galls, LLC 

NARDIS 
PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

1 

Armor Express – Package 1  
• 1 Revolution Carrier (Black) 

• 1 Traverse Overt Carrier System (Black & Coyote) 

• 1 Pair (front & back) Halo Level II Soft ballistic panels 

• 1 7”x10” Ara Shock ICW Trauma plate Level 3A 

• 1 Set of ID Tags 

$797.00 

 
$1048.89 

$799.00 $815.00 

Safariland 
SX02 Package 

2 

Armor Express – Package 2 
• 2 Revolution Carrier (Black) 

• 1 Pair (front & back) Halo Level II Soft ballistic panels 

• 1 7”x10” Ara Shock ICW Trauma plate Level 3A 

$676.00 

 
 

$922.50 $685.00 $663.00 
Safariland 

SX02 Package 

3 

Armor Express – Package 3 
• 1 Revolution Carrier (Black) 

• 1 Pair (front & back) Halo Level II Soft ballistic panels 

• 1 7”x10” Ara Shock ICW Trauma plate Level 3A 

$591.00 
 

$837.50 $610.00 $620.00 
Safariland 

SX02 Package 

4 

Armor Express – Package 4  
• 1 Traverse Half Molle Carriers (LAPD NAVY) 

• 1 Pair (front & back) Halo Level II Soft ballistic panels 

• 1 7”x10” Ara Shock ICW Trauma plate Level 3A 

$694.00 
 

$949.89 $712.00 $725.00 
Safariland 

SX02 Package 

5 

Armor Express – Package 5  
• 2 Revolution Carrier (Black) 

• 1 Traverse Half Molle Carrier (LAPD Navy)  

• 1 Pair (front & back) Halo Level II Soft ballistic panels 

• 1 7”x10” Ara Shock ICW Trauma plate Level 3A 

$779.00 

 
 

$1034.89 $785.00 $815.00 

Safariland 
SX02 Package 

 

6 

Armor Express – Package 6 
• 2 Revolution Carrier (Black) 

• 1 Pair (front & back) Gemini Level II Spike 2 panels 

• 1 7”x10” Ara Shock ICW Trauma plate Level 3A 

$899.00 

 
 

$597.50 $1040.00 $1135.00 
Safariland 

Prism Package 
 

 

7 

Armor Express – Package 7  
• 1 Revolution Carrier (Black) 

• 1 Traverse Half Molle Carrier (LAPD Navy)  

$1067.00 

 
 

$1159.89 $1100.00 $1375.00 

Safariland 
SX02 Package 



• 1 Pair (front & back) Razor Gen 2 Level II soft ballistic 
panels 

• 1 Pair (front and back) Surge Level 3 8" x 10" multi 
curve shooters cut trauma plates 

 

 
Blauer Package 

Item Model  Item Description Diexon 
Group, LLC 

G T 
Distributo

rs, Inc. 
Galls, LLC 

NARDIS 
PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

8 8450 

Blauer – LS Shirt – Mens 
• Dark Navy, zipper added, GD/DN piggyback 

epaulet, department shoulder patches, Texas Star 
gold buttons 

No Bid 

 
$86.99 

$81.28 

 

$99.50 

$113.09 
4XL+ 

3X- $109.50 
4X- $129.35 
5X- $174.25 

9 8460 
Blauer – SS Shirt – Mens 

• Dark Navy, zipper added, GD/DN piggyback 
epaulet, department shoulder patches, Texas Star 
gold buttons 

No Bid 

$75.99 
$75.02 

$89.50 

$98.78 
4XL+ 

3X- $107.40 
4X- $116.35 
5X- $155.99 

10 8450
W 

Blauer – LS Shirt – Womens 
• Dark Navy, zipper added, GD/DN piggyback 

epaulet, department shoulder patches, Texas Star 
gold buttons 

No Bid 

 
$86.99 

$75.80 

$99.50 

$113.09 
4XL+ 

3X- $109.50 
4X- $129.35 
5X- $147.25 

11 8460
W 

Blauer – LS Shirt – Womens 

• Dark Navy, zipper added, GD/DN piggyback 
epaulet, department shoulder patches, Texas Star 
gold buttons 

No Bid 

 
$75.99 

$70.10 

$89.50 

$98.78 
4XL+ 

3X- $107.40 
4X- $116.35 
5X- $174.25 

12 8560 
Blauer – Pants – Mens 

• Pink Tan, 4 pocket GD/DN piggyback stripe, 
finished hem 

No Bid 

 
$91.99 $77.00 $89.50 

$119.58 

13 8560
W 

Blauer – Pants – Womens 

• Pink Tan, 4 pocket GD/DN piggyback stripe, 
finished hem 

No Bid 
$91.99 $77.00 $89.50 
$119.58 

14 8560 Blauer – Pants – Mens 

• Pink Tan, 4 pocket, finished hem No Bid 
$83.99 $71.00 $79.15 
$109.18 

15 8560
W 

Blauer – Pants – Womens 

• Pink Tan, 4 pocket, finished hem No Bid 
$83.99 $71.00 $79.15 
$109.18 

16 9810Z 
Blauer – Jacket-Cruiser 

• Dark Navy w/liner, department shoulder patches, 
gold texas star buttons, badge patch (left breast) 

No Bid $165.00 $165.00 
$158.99 

 



Item Model  Item Description Diexon 
Group, LLC 

G T 
Distributo

rs, Inc. 
Galls, LLC 

NARDIS 
PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

$214.00 
4X- $185.99 
5X- $259.99 

17 9810Z 
Blauer – Jacket-Cruiser 

• Dark Navy w/liner, department shoulder patches, 
gold texas star buttons 

No Bid 
$165.00 

$165.00 
$158.99 

$214.00 
4X- $185.99 
5X- $259.99 

18 26976 
Blauer – Raincoat 

• Rain Coat High-Vis with hood attached with 5 
snaps and specified lettering 

No Bid 
$261.25 

$144.22 
$144.99 

$339.00 
4X- $175.50 
5X- $191.24 

19 8666 Blauer – Pants – Mens 

• Tundra w/finished hem No Bid 
$64.99 $66.16 $58.50 
$84.48 

20 8666
W 

Blauer – Pants – Womens 

• Tundra w/finished hem No Bid 
$64.99 $60.36 $58.50 
$84.48 

21 2512 

Blauer – Jacket-Ike (Honor Guard) 

• Dark Navy, GD/DN piggyback epaulet, 
department shoulder patches, Texas Star gold 
buttons 

No Bid 
$385.00 

$190.00 $259.99 

$500.50 

22 8471 Blauer – LS Base Shirt – Mens 

• Dark Navy, department shoulder patches No Bid 
$52.89 

$53.00 
$48.50 

$68.75 
4X- $64.35 
5X- $86.65 

23 8472 Blauer – SS Base Shirt – Mens 

• Dark Navy, department shoulder patches No Bid 
$46.15 

$47.00 
$44.50 

$59.99 
4X- $56.99 
5X- $78.99 

24 8471
W 

Blauer – LS Base Shirt – Mens 

• Dark Navy, department shoulder patches No Bid 
$52.89 

$53.00 
$48.50 

$68.75 
4X- $64.35 
5X- $86.65 

25 8472
W 

Blauer – SS Base Shirt – Mens 

• Dark Navy, department shoulder patches No Bid 
$46.15 

$47.00 
$44.50 

$59.99 
4X- $56.99 
5X- $78.99 

26  Buttons 

• Texas Star gold buttons w/clasps and washers No Bid $1.00 $1.45 $1.10 

27 
VHB-

J1-
GDP 

Blankinton – Name Tag 

• Brass with Navy Lettering 2 1/2 " x 1/2" No Bid $10.50 $9.00 $10.99 

28 VHB-
J1-SVP 

Blankinton – Name Tag 

• Silver with Navy Lettering 2 1/2 " x 1/2" No Bid $10.50 $9.00 $10.99 



Item Model  Item Description Diexon 
Group, LLC 

G T 
Distributo

rs, Inc. 
Galls, LLC 

NARDIS 
PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

29  Herospride – Sew  on Rank Insignia 

• Corporal and Sergeant,  (Gold/Navy) No Bid PAIR 
 $2.15 

$1.25 $1.39 

30  Herospride – Sew  on Insignia 

• Hash marks (Gold/Navy) No Bid $0.85 $0.95 $1.25 

 
Duty Gear Package 

Item Model Item Description Diexon 
Group, LLC 

G T 
Distributo

rs, Inc. 

Galls, LLC 
 

NARDIS 
PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

31 SAF-146-4B Safariland – BW Duty Belt  
 

$56.85 $47.77 
$50.00 $69.29 

46” 
$64.75 $49.77 

32   RH      7360-
8325-4811 

Safariland – BW Gun Holster  
 

$125.75 $104.81 $125.93 $144.70 

33       LH  7360-
8325-482 

Safariland – BW Gun Holster  
 

$125.75 $104.81 $119.65 $144.70 

34 RH 7360-
835-481 

Safariland – BW Gun Holster /no light  
 

$117.35 $95.64 $109.18 $131.99 

35 LH 7360-
835-482 

Safariland – BW Gun Holster /no light  
 

$117.35 $95.64 $109.18 $131.99 

36 QUICK-KIT1-
2 

Safariland – Quick Release Kit  
 

$20.25 $16.66 $17.44 $22.18 

37 SAF-77-83-
4HS 

Safariland – BW Magazine Pouch 
 

$31.75 $26.66 $27.90 $28.47 

38 SAF-90H-
4HS 

Safariland – BW Handcuff Pouch 
 

$24.80 $25.55 $21.76 $28.47 

39 62-4-4HS Safariland – BW Belt Keepers (set of 4) 
 

$18.20 $15.27 $16.17 $20.89 

40 SAF-306-2-4 Safariland – BW Flashlight Holder 
 

$22.80 $19.16 $19.11 $26.20 

41  SF77-83-4B 
Safariland – BW Magazine Case (Brass 
snaps) 
 

$31.75 $30.27 $28.23 $32.40 

42 SAF-90-4B Safariland – BW Handcuff case (Brass snap) 
 

$24.75 $20.83 $21.76 $28.48 

43 85-0924 
North American Rescue – Tourniquet & 
Holder 
 

$59.75 $38.92 $54.09 No Bid 



Item Model Item Description Diexon 
Group, LLC 

G T 
Distributo

rs, Inc. 

Galls, LLC 
 

NARDIS 
PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

44 SF-G2XD-D-
BK 

G2X Pro – Flashlight 
 

$59.65 $68.69 $49.40 $67.09 

45 44HT00BK Blackhawk– Taser Holster 
 

$38.00 No Bid $30.68 $48.80 

46 100-1 Nickel Smith & Wesson – Handcuffs 
 

$27.50 $21.92 $31.94 $31.50 

47 STL-69110 Streamlight – Flashlight Black TLR-1 
 

$123.90 $98.77 $103.24 $194.99 

48 56096 5.11 – 3x6 med kit pouch 
 

$23.25 No Bid $17.75 No Bid 

49 
Sierra Bravo 

Duty Belt 
Plus 

5.11 – Duty Belt 
 

$41.35 
No Bid $32.32 No Bid 

2XL – 4XL 
$47.75 

50 
Model 73 

Nylon Open 
Top 

Safariland – Pistol Mag Pouch 
 

$29.75 $21.11 $25.88 No Bid 

51 6004-8 Safariland – Small Molle adapter plate 
 

$25.00 $31.66 $21.50 No Bid 

52 Duty Taco High Speed Gear – Rifle Mag Pouch 
 

$29.00 $32.19 $31.76 No Bid 

53 Duty Taco 
Double 

High Speed Gear – Flashlight Pouch 
 

$23.50 $35.12 $22.00 No Bid 

54 Duty Taco High Speed Gear – Radio Pouch 
 

$39.60 $37.31 $36.00 No Bid 

55 Duty Taco High Speed Gear – Tourniquet Pouch 
 

$31.60 $28.53 $26.82 No Bid 

56 
Body Cam 

Wise 
WatchGuard 

Zero9 Holsters – Body Camera Mount 
 

$42.25 No Bid $25.51 No Bid 

57 Serpa 
38CL63BK 

Blackhawk – Taser Holster-Molle 
Conversion Mount 
 

$13.50 No Bid  $10.43 No Bid 

58 8100-Black Bianchi – Duty Belt Nylon Web Patroltek 2" 
 

$21.00 No Bid $18.23 No Bid 

59 8006-Black Bianchi – Belt keepers- Patroltek (set of 4) 
 

$8.80 No Bid $7.64 No Bid 

60 7300-Black Bianchi – Handcuff case-covered   
 

$21.60 $17.39 $18.82 No Bid 

61 8002-Black Bianchi – Mag Pouch-Nylon $19.50 No Bid $17.05 No Bid 



Item Model Item Description Diexon 
Group, LLC 

G T 
Distributo

rs, Inc. 

Galls, LLC 
 

NARDIS 
PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 

62 8105 Bianchi – Glove Pouch-Nylon 
 

$11.15 No Bid $9.70 No Bid 

63 7307 Bianchi – Mace/OC Holder  
 

$17.55 $14.13 $15.88 No Bid 

64 7308 Bianchi – Mace/OC Holder (Open Top) 
 

$15.20 $12.22 $13.23 No Bid 

65 7906 
Bianchi – Belt Keepers (Brass snaps)(set of 
4) 
 

$13.85 $10.69 $9.41 No Bid 

 
Uniforms (other) Package 

Item Model Item Description 
Diexon 
Group, 

LLC 

G T 
Distribut
ors, Inc. 

Galls, 
LLC 

NARDIS 
PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

66 72175 
5.11 – LS Shirt – Mens – Taclite Pro 

• Black, 2 shoulder patches, name tape, badge on left 
breast and rank on collar(if applicable) 

No Bid No Bid $46.00 $59.99 

67 72175
T 

5.11 – LS Shirt – Mens – Taclite Pro 
• Black, 2 shoulder patches, name tape, badge on left 

breast and rank on collar(if applicable) 
No Bid No Bid $46.00 $64.99 

68 62070 
5.11 – LS Shirt – Womens – Taclite Pro 

• Black, 2 shoulder patches, name tape, badge on left 
breast and rank on collar(if applicable) 

No Bid No Bid $44.00 $54.99 

69 74273 5.11 – Pants – Mens – Taclite Pro 
• Black-Hemmed 

No Bid No Bid $36.00 
$44.99 

46-54 $53.00 

70 74273
L 

5.11 – Pants – Mens – Taclite Pro 
• Black-Hemmed No Bid No Bid $36.00 

$44.99 

46-54 $57.00 

71 64360 5.11 – Pants – Womens – Taclite Pro 
• Black-Hemmed No Bid No Bid $36.00 $47.95 

72 8000N Tact Squad – Blazer – Mens 

• Navy No Bid 
$48.00 

$36.00 $52.99 
$56.00 

73 8000N
W 

Tact Squad – Blazer – Womens 

• Navy No Bid 
$48.00 

36.00 $52.99 
$56.00 

74 7002H
E 

Tact Squad – Pants – Mens 

• Heather Grey-Hemmed No Bid 
$22.36 

$15.50 $20.99 
$26.00 



Item Model Item Description 
Diexon 
Group, 

LLC 

G T 
Distribut
ors, Inc. 

Galls, 
LLC 

NARDIS 
PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

75 7002H
EW 

Tact Squad – Pants – Womens 

• Heather Grey-Hemmed No Bid 
$22.35 

$15.50 $20.99 
$26.00 

76 
ZDC60
SHERI

FFl 

Tact Squad – Traffic Vest 

• Fluorescent Yellow w/"Sheriff" front and back in black 
lettering 

No Bid No Bid $26.00 
$33.15 

3X-6X $38.36 

77 2448 Tru-Spec – Jacket-24-7 Series Tactical softshell 

• Black No Bid 
$80.75 $72.00 

$85.99 

$89.00 2X-5X $95.99 

78 CS410 

Cornerstone –SS Polo– Mens 

• Navy w/gold monogramming and Black w/Red 
monogramming SO logo left breast and division identifier 
on right breast 

No Bid 

$36.85 
$32.36 

$29.99 

$39.85 3X-4X $31.99 

79 TLCS4
10 

Cornerstone – SS Polo Tall – Mens  

• Navy w/gold monogramming and Black w/Red 
monogramming SO logo left breast and division identifier 
on right breast 

No Bid 

$39.00 
$32.36 

$31.99 

$43.00 3X-4X $33.99 

80 CS411 

Cornerstone – SS Polo – Womens 

• Navy w/gold monogramming and Black w/Red 
monogramming SO logo left breast and division identifier 
on right breast 

No Bid 

$36.85 
$32.36 $34.99 

$39.85 

81  Tri-Mountain – Jacket-Panorama 

• Navy/Khaki w/gold SO logo left breast No Bid 

$63.75 
$70.00 

$50.34 

$71.75 LT-3XT $63.50 
4XT-6X $69.52 

82 5300 Uniform Cravats / Samuel Broome – Tie, Clip-on  

• Navy Blue 18", 20", 22" and 24" lengths No Bid $4.00 $4.00 $5.89 

83 BD249 Lawpro – Tie Bar 

• Brass No Bid $3.65 $3.00 $3.89 

84 
Large 
and 

Small 

Smith & Warren – Pin on Rank Insignia 

• Corporal, Sergeant, Lieutenant and Captain (Gold) No Bid $14.50 $3.50 $2.89 

 
Awarded in Commissioner’s Court on March 22, 2021 to the following: 

Award for Armor Package to : Diexon Group, LLC dba Tactica Training Solutions 

Award for Blauer Package to : Galls, LLC 

Multi- Award for Duty Gear Package to : G T Distributors, Inc. for items 31 , 32 , 33 , 34 , 35 , 36 , 37 
, 39 , 42 , 43 , 46 , 47 , 50 , 60 , 63 , 64 and to Galls, LLC for items 38 , 40 , 41 , 44 , 45 , 48 , 49 , 51 , 52 
, 53 , 54 , 55 , 56 , 57 , 58 , 59 , 61 , 62 , 65 

Award for Uniforms (other) Package to : Galls, LLC 
 


