
1 
 

ITB 221101 
Asphalt Materials - OPR:  Consolidated Road & Bridge 

 
Vendors Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. P2 Emulsions Wright Asphalt Products Company, Inc. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

(A) 

Price per Gallon 

 
(B) 

Del. Charge 
per Gallon 

 
(A + B) 

Total Price per 
Gallon 

(A) 

Price per Gallon 

 
(B) 

Del. Charge 
per Gallon 

 
(A + B) 

Total Price per 
Gallon 

(A) 

Price per Gallon 

 
(B) 

Del. Charge 
per Gallon 

 
(A + B) 

Total Price per 
Gallon 

CMS-1P 

 

$2.50 $0.15 $2.65 No Bid No Bid 

CMS-1PF $2.50 $0.15 $2.65 No Bid No Bid 

CHFRS-2P $2.80 $0.15 $2.95 No Bid $2.80 $0.335 $3.135 

CRS-2P $2.80 $0.15 $2.95 No Bid $2.80 $0.335 $3.135 

CRS-2 

 

 

$2.45 $0.15 $2.60 *$2.74 $0.25 $2.99 $2.50 $0.335 $2.835 
CRS-1P 

 

 

*$2.90 $0.15 $3.05 No Bid No Bid 

AC10-2TR $3.05 $0.15 $3.20 No Bid $2.90 $0.341 $3.241 

AC20-5TR $3.15 $0.15 $3.30 No Bid $2.90 $0.341 $3.241 

AC-10 $2.65 $0.15 $2.80 No Bid $2.60 $0.341 $2.941 

AC-5 $2.85 $0.15 $3.00 No Bid $2.70 $0.341 $3.041 

CSS-1H TACK OIL $2.50 $0.15 $2.65 **$2.44 $0.25 $2.69 $2.50 $0.335 $2.835 
CSS-1H TACK OIL 1:1 $1.40 $0.15 $1.55 ***$1.74 $0.25 $1.99 $1.45 $0.335 $1.785 

AC-10 XP $3.15 $0.15 $3.30 No Bid No Bid 

AC-20XP $3.20 $0.15 $3.35 No Bid $3.00 $0.341 $3.341 

AC 15P $3.25 $0.15 $3.40 No Bid $3.05 $0.341 $3.391 

MC-30 No Bid No Bid $3.50 $0.312 $3.812 
AE-P $2.75 $0.15 $2.90 ****$1.75 $0.25 $2.00 No Bid 
AE-P50/50 $1.53 $0.15 $1.68 No Bid No Bid 
FastSet Fog Seal 60/40 Dilute No Bid *****$2.57 $0.25 $2.82 *$2.65 $0.341 $2.991 

CSS 1P Diluted 50% No Bid No Bid No Bid 

PASS CR No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Alternates: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. 
*CRS-1P substitute CMS-2P 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Alternates: P2 Emulsions 
*CRS-2 substitute P2 CWE-2 
**CSS-1H TACK OIL substitute P2 S1 
*** CSS-1H TACK OIL 1:1 substitute P2 S1 
****AE-P substitute P2 RTU  
*****FastSet Fog Seal 60/40 Dilute substitute P2 ROC 

 
 

 

Alternates: Wright Asphalt Products Company, Inc. 
*FastSet Fog Seal 60/40 Dilute substitute TR Fog 
MC-800TR     $3.05  |   $0.341   |  $3.391 
MC-3000TR   $3.00  |   $0.341   |  $3.341 
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Alternates: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. 
 
This bid is for full transport loads of 5,500 
gallons. Freight is based on a full transport 
load, even if a full load of material is not 
ordered. The common carrier bills demurrage 
at $90.00 per hour, after the second hour. 
Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff. 
Pump and hose charge is $90.00 per load. For 
equipment ordered, but not used, carrier may 
charge up to $400.00. 
  
A Federal Environmental Fee will be added to 
bid prices at a rate of $.49770/ton for asphalt 
& polymer loads or $.00150/gallon for 
emulsion loads. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Alternates: P2 Emulsions 
 
-All listed prices are per U.S. gallon  
-Minimum Tanker Delivery: 5,000 Gallons  
-Delivery over 250 miles subject to additional charges  
-Demurrage (trucking charge): First 2 hours free, $80.00 
per hour thereafter  
-Pump Charge (trucking charge): $80.00  
-Push Charge (trucking charge): $80.00 per hour  
-Return Loads (trucking charge): Subject to charge from 
delivering freight line  
-Smaller Quantities Available, Subject to Freight 
Differential of $0.25/gal less than 5,000 gal 
 
Containers available for smaller product amounts :  
"Tote" Containers (275 gallons size each) cost $100.00 
per container  
"Drum" Containers (55 gallons size each) cost $35.00 
per drum 
Containers are re-usable and can be rinsed out, brought 
back and re-filled at customer discretion.  
Containers priced individually and sold only with orders 
for material. 

 

Alternates: Wright Asphalt Products Company, Inc. 
 
 Demurrage: 2 Free Hours then $100 Per Hour 
Pump Charge: $150 per Truck per Load 
(not provided for hot asphalts) 
Diversion Charge: $75 per Additional Stop plus Additional 
Miles 
Layover Charge: $750 per Truck per Night 

 
Award To: Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc., P2 Emulsions , Wright Asphalt Products Company, Inc. 


