
WOODROW 
ITB 220106 

BID SUMMARY 
VOLUNTEER FIRE DEPARTMENT 

 PERSONAL PROTECTIVE EQUIPMENT 
LUBBOCK COUNTY 

Item 1: Commissioners Court drew lots in a manner prescribed by the County Judge, per Local 
Government Code §262.027(b) and was awarded to Daco Fire Equipment.  

Daco Fire Equipment: Items #2, #7, #9, #10, #11, #12, #13 - Does not meet brand name or 
equal. 

SanitizeNow, Inc.: Items #2, #5, #6, #7 and #10 - Does not meet brand name or equal and/or 
specifications.  

Vendor 

Item Description Quantity Daco Fire Equipment Casco Industries, Inc. 
SanitizeNow 

Inc. 

Heat Safety 
Equipment 

LLC 

1 Particulate Blocking 
Protective Hoods 

28 EA $84.00 $84.00 $115.21 No Bid 

2 Traditional Fire Helmet 28 EA $390.00 No Bid 
3 Wildfire Helmet 28 EA $49.96 $60.00 $67.50 No Bid 

4 
Hot Shield Wildland Face 
Protector Mask, Model: 
HS 2 

28 EA $60.00 $67.00 $77.50 No Bid 

5 Wildland Goggles 28 EA $42.00 $53.00 No Bid 

6 Structural Gloves 28 SETS 
R-$99.00 
L-$99.00 

R-$74.00 
L-N/A No Bid 

7 
Protective Jacket and 
Pants for Structural Fire 
Fighting 

Jacket 
28 EA 

Pants 
28 EA 

JR-$2060.00 
60” & Up -$2678.00 

PR-$1490.00 
60” & Up -$1937.00 

No Bid 

8 

Tech Rescue Dual 
certified Series Fire 
Fighter Protective Coat & 
Pant 

Jacket 
28 EA 

Pants 
28 EA 

JR-$443.00 
JL-$443.00 

PR-$394.00 
PL-$394.00 

JR-$362.00 
56”-58”-$398.00 
60”-62”-$416.00 
64”-66”-$434.00 

68” & Over -$452.00 

PR-$308.00 
50”-52”-$339.00 
54”-56”-$354.00 
58”-60”-$369.00 

Over 60”-$385.00 

JR-$595.00 

PR-$595.00 
No Bid 

9 Structural Fire Fighting 
14” Pull On Boots 

28 SETS 
R-$452.00 

L -Wide Calf-
$604.00 

$962.00 No Bid 

10 10” Station/Wildland 
Boots 

28 SETS $384.00 No Bid 

11 
3M Scott Air Pak 
Facepiece Assembly with 
Kevlar Head Harness 

28 EA No Bid $476.67 $315.71 

12 
3M Combination 
Cartridge/Filter, Organic 
Vapor/P100 

28 EA No Bid $30.61 $20.56321 

13 3M Scott AV 632 Bayonet 
Adapter 

28 EA No Bid $78.53 $46.30 



 

Multi-Award:  

Daco Fire Equipment for Item 3, Item 4, Item 5; 

Casco Industries, Inc. for Item 2, Item 6, Item 7, Item 8, Item 9 and Item 10. 

Heat Safety Equipment LLC for Item 11, Item 12 and Item 13. 

 

 


