
SLATON	
ITB	220205	

BID	SUMMARY	
VOLUNTEER	FIRE	DEPARTMENT	

PERSONAL	PROTECTIVE	EQUIPMENT	
LUBBOCK	COUNTY	

Daco	Fire	Equipment: Item #2, #3, #4 - Does not meet brand name or equal. 

SanitizeNow,	Inc.: Item #6 – Does not meet brand name or equal. 

Municipal	Emergency	Services,	Inc.	will	be	awarded	Item	1,	Item	5,	Item	6,	Item	7;	

Heat	Safety	Equipment	will	be	awarded	Items	2	through	4 

Vendor	
Item	 Description Quantity Municipal 

Emergency Services, 
Inc. 

Daco Fire 
Equipment 

Heat Safety 
Equipment 

Metro Fire 
Apparatus 

Specialists Inc 
SanitizeNow Inc. 

1	 Veridian Viper 
Protective Hoods 

26	EA	 $	37.40	 $ 84.00 No Bid No Bid $ 58.00 

2	

3M Scott 
Facepiece 
Assembly with 
Kevlar Head 
Harness (Model: 
AV-3000 HT) 

26	EA	 $ 360.28 $ 250.00 $	296.22	 $ 330.00 $ 453.00 

3	

3M Combination 
Cartridge/Filter, 
Organic 
Vapor/P100 

60	EA	 $ 695.26 $ 48.00 $	10.283	 $ 23.00 $ 70.34 

4	 3M Scott AV-632 
Bayonet Adapter 

30	EA	 $ 255.40 $ 88.00 $	46.30	 $ 65.00 $ 85.11 

5	 Veridian M1X Fire 
Fit Gloves 

26	SETS	 $	79.07	 $ 99.00 No Bid  No Bid $ 86.63 

6	

FXR Coat and 
Pants for Fire 
Fighting Gear 

Coat		
26	EA	

Coat	Regular	–	
$	1,625.20		

Coat	4XL‐5XL‐	
$	1,820.22	

Pant	Regular	‐	

Coat –  
$ 1,968.00 

No Bid 

Coat S-5XL – 
$ 1,878.00 

Coat –  
$ 660.00 

Pant	
26	EA	

$	1,150.16		
Pant	4XL‐5XL	‐	
$	1,288.35		

Pant –  
 $ 1,332.00 

Pant S-5XL –  
$ 1,322.00 

Pant –  
$ 630.00 

7	 Flexfire Warrior 
Structural Boot 

26	SETS	 $	500.38	 No Bid No Bid  No Bid $ 503.37 


