
 

 

ITB 241001 UNIFORMS 
SHERIFFS OFFICE 

5.11 Brand Items:     VENDORS 

Aimpoint Brand Items: 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
Item Description  

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

 
NARDIS PUBLIC 

SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
3 

 
200342 

3X-C MAGNIFIER WITH 
FLIPMOUNT 39MM & TWISTMOUNT 
BASE 

 
$674.47 

 
$788.21 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

AVON Brand Items: 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
4 

 
FM53 

 
MULTIPLE MISSION GAS MASK AVON $1,493.82 NO BID NO BID $1,259.30 NO BID NO BID 

 

5 

CTCF50 
AVONP- 
726063 

 
GAS MASK FILTERS for FM-53 GAS  
MASK -FILTER CTCF50 

 
$175.41 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID $171.11 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

Bianchi Brand Items: 
 

 

 

 
Item 

 

 

 

 
Model 

 

 

 

 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 

7 

 

8002-Black 

DOUBLE MAGAZINE POUCH NO BID $32.67 $36.76 NO BID NO BID $24.24 

 

8 

 

7906 

BASKET WEAVE BELT KEEPERS 
NO BID $24.44 $16.79 NO BID NO BID $15.85 ꞏ Brass Snaps (set of 4) 

 

9 

 

8100 

BLACK NYLON PATROLTEK 2” DUTY  
BELT NO BID $65.99 $52.70 REGULAR 

$54.40 OVERSIZED 
NO BID NO BID NO BID 

10 
 

8006 

BLACK NYLON BELT KEEPERS –  
PATROL TEK 

NO BID $20.24 $17.85 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

ꞏ (set of 4) 

11 
 

NP168 

ACCUMOLD NYLON BELT KEEPERS NO BID $24.08 $16.36 NO BID NO BID $16.47 

 

12 

 

ZQ826 

NYLON GLOVE POUCH BI02 7328 22960 NO BID $28.46 $21.46 NO BID NO BID $20.01 

 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

 
DANA SAFETY  

SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORMS 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

 
NARDIS PUBLIC 

SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
1 

 
59505 

 
SIERRA BRAVO BELT KIT – 2” 

$40.25 REGULAR 
$44.50 OVERSIZED 

$55.01 $50.15 NO BID $58.99 $47.50 

 
2 

 
56096 

 
3x6 MED KIT POUCH NO BID $36.27 $31.03 NO BID NO BID NO BID 



 

 

Blackhawk Brand Items: 

 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
 

13 

 
44HT00BK 

R 

 
TASER HOLSTER – RIGHT HAND 

 
$31.90 

 
$66.15 

 
$46.71 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
$41.27 

14 
44HT00BK 

L TASER HOLSTER – LEFT HAND $31.90 $66.15 $46.71 NO BID NO BID $41.27 
 

15 
 

38CL63BK 
SERPA S.T.R.I.K.E PLATFORM 
AMBIDEXTRIOUS $10.85 $25.20 $15.68 NO BID NO BID $15.00 

Blankinton Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
 

16 

 
VHB-J1- 

GDP 

NAME TAG  
$10.35 

 
$10.95 

 
$14.37 

 
NO BID 

 
$21.99 

 
$12.80 ꞏ Gold with Navy Lettering 2 

1/2" x 1/2" 

 
 

17 

 
VHB-J1- 

SVP 

NAME TAG  
$10.35 

 
$10.95 

 
$14.37 

 
NO BID 

 
$21.99 

 
$12.80 ꞏ Silver with Navy Lettering 2 

1/2" x 1/2" 

Blauer Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
 

18 

 
 

8450 

LS SHIRT – MENS  
 

NO BID 

 
 

$119.51* $136.26 REGULAR 
$175.36 OVERSIZED 

 
 

NO BID $94.25 REGULAR 
$119.25 4XL 

 
 

$122.80 
Dark Navy, zipper added, GD/DN 
piggyback epaulet, department shoulder 
patches, gold buttons 

 

 
 

19 

 
 

8460 

SS SHIRT – MENS 
Dark Navy, zipper added, GD/DN 
piggyback epaulet, department shoulder 
patches, 

 
 

NO BID 

 
 

$112.73* 
$116.36 REGULAR 

$141.86 OVERSIZED 

 
 

NO BID 

 
$85.99 REGULAR 

 
 

$117.15 
$114.25 4XL 

 
 

20 

 
 

8450W 

LS SHIRT - WOMENS  
 

NO BID 

 
 

$119.51* 

 
 

$136.26 

 
 

NO BID 

  
 

$122.80 
ꞏ Dark Navy, zipper added, GD/DN piggyback 
epaulet, department shoulder 
ꞏ patches, Texas Star gold buttons 

$94.25 REGULAR 
$119.25 3XL AND UP 

 

 
 

21 

 
 

8460W 

SS SHIRT – WOMENS  
 
 

NO BID 

 
 
 

$112.73* 

 
 
 

$116.36 

 
 
 

NO BID 

  
 
 

$117.15 

ꞏ Dark Navy, zipper added, GD/DN 
piggyback epaulet, department shoulder 
patches, gold buttons 

$85.99 REGULAR 
$114.25 3XL AND UP 

 
 
 

22 

 
 

8560 

PINK TAN PANTS – MENS  
NO BID 

 
$117.84* 

 
$118.99 

 
NO BID 

 
$91.00 

 
NO BID 4 pocket GD/DN piggyback stripe, finished hem 

 
 

23 

 
 

8560W 

PINK TAN PANTS – WOMENS  
NO BID 

 
$117.84* 

 
$118.99 

 
NO BID 

 
$91.00 

 
NO BID 4 pocket GD/DN piggyback stripe, finished hem 



 

 

 
 

24 
 

8560 
PINK TAN PANTS – MENS 

NO BID $117.84* $107.09 NO BID $83.50 NO BID ꞏ 4 pocket , finished hem 
 

25 
 

8560W 
PINK TAN PANTS – WOMENS 

NO BID $117.84* $107.09 NO BID $83.50 NO BID ꞏ 4 pocket , finished hem 
 

26 
 

8666 
TUNDRA PANTS - MENS 

NO BID $70.37* $84.99 NO BID $77.50 $86.75 ꞏ With finished hem 
 

27 
 

8666 
BLACK PANTS - MENS 

NO BID $77.98* $84.99 NO BID $77.50 $86.75 ꞏ With finished hem 
 

28 
 

8666W 
TUNDRA PANTS - WOMENS 

NO BID $70.37* $84.99 NO BID $77.50 $86.75 ꞏ With finished hem 
 

29 
 

8666W 
BLACK PANTS - WOMENS 

NO BID $77.98* $84.99 NO BID $77.50 $86.75 ꞏ With finished hem 

 
 

30 

 
 

8471 

LS BASE SHIRT – MENS  
NO BID 

 
$70.15* $72.24 REGULAR 

$94.34 EXTENDED 

 

NO BID 

$63.50 REGULAR  
$67.89 

ꞏ Dark Navy, Department shoulder patches $99.99 3XL AND UP 

 
31 

 
 

8471 

LS BASE SHIRT – MENS  
NO BID 

 
$57.21* 

$72.24 REGULAR 
$94.34 EXTENDED 

 
NO BID $67.45 REGULAR 

$92.45 EXTENDED 

 
$67.89 Black, Department shoulder patches silver 

and black 
 
 

32 

 
 

8472 

SS BASE SHIRT - MENS  
NO BID 

 
$61.44* 

 
$63.74 

 
NO BID 

$58.21 REGULAR 

$63.00 3XL AND UP 

 
$61.00 Dark Navy, Department shoulder patches 

 
 

33 

 
 

8471W 

LS BASE SHIRT - WOMENS  
NO BID 

 
$70.15* 

 
$72.24 

 
NO BID 

$63.50 REGULAR 

$68.50 EXTENDED 

 
$67.89 Dark Navy, Department shoulder patches 

 
34 

 
8471W 

LS BASE SHIRT – WOMENS NO BID $70.15* $72.24 NO BID $63.50 REGULAR 
$68.50 EXTENDED 

$67.89 
Black, Department shoulder 

 
 

35 

 
 

8472W 

SS BASE SHIRT – WOMENS  
NO BID 

 
$61.44* 

 
$63.74 

 
NO BID $58.21 REGULAR 

$63.21 EXTENDED 

 
$61.00 Dark Navy, Department 

shoulder patches 

 
 

36 

 
 

JC872 

NAVY TACSHELL SHELL ONLY W/ 
DEPARTMENT PATCHES & HEAT 
TRANSFER 

 
NO BID 

 
$247.30* $299.74 REGULAR 

$385.17 OVERSIZED 

 
NO BID $248.20 REGULAR 

$276.20 EXTENDED 

 
$299.24 

 
 

37 

 
 

JC590 

 
DKNV SOFTSHELL FLEECE 4660 
W/ HEAT TRANSFER 

 
NO BID 

 
$138.40* 

$159.49 REGULAR 
$202.84 OVERSIZED 

 
NO BID 

 
$147.19** 

 
$140.24 

 
 

38 

 
RW1443H 

S 

DRY REVERSABLE RAINCOAT  
NO BID 

 
$157.23* $216.43 REGULAR 

$235.13 OVERSIZED 

 
NO BID 

 
$239.50 

 
NO BID With 5 snaps on jacket & Hood w/ Heat 

Transfer 

 
 

39 

 
 

2512 

IKE JACKET  

NO BID 

 

$198.91* 
$146.22 REGULAR 

$160.84 OVERSIZED 

 

NO BID 

 

$285.00 

 

$315.00 Dark Navy, GD/DN piggyback epaulet, 
department shoulder patches, Texas start gold 
buttons 

  

   
   

Cornerstone Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
 

40 

 
 

CS418 

SS POLO SHIRT – MENS  
 

NO BID 
$52.39 REGULAR 

$53.39 OVERSIZED 

 
$34.68 REGULAR 

$39.78 OVERSIZED 

 
 

NO BID 

 
$24.50 REGULAR 

$29.99 EXTENDED 

 
 

$50.74 
Dark Navy w/gold monogramming, 
Sheriff Office logo on left breast, 
identifier on 

 



 

 

 
 

41 

 
 

CS418 

SS POLO SHIRT – MENS  
 

NO BID 

 
$52.39 REGULAR 

$53.39 OVERSIZED 

 
$34.68 REGULAR 

$39.78 OVERSIZED 

 
 

NO BID 

 
$24.50 REGULAR 

$29.99 EXTENDED 

 
 

$50.74 
Red w/ Black monogramming, Sheriff 
Office logo on left breast, identifier on right 
breast 

 
 

42 

 
 

TLCS412 

SS TALL POLO SHIRT – MENS  
 

NO BID 

 
$57.99 REGULAR 

$58.99 OVERSIZED 

 
$43.18 REGUALR 

$46.58 OVERSIZED 

 
 

NO BID $32.30 

 
 

$56.80 
Dark Navy w/gold monogramming, 
Sheriff Office logo on left breast, 
identifier on 

 
 

43 

 
 

CS419 

SS POLO SHIRT – WOMENS  
 

NO BID 

 
$52.39 REGULAR 

$53.39 OVERSIZED 

 
$34.68 REGULAR 

$39.78 OVERSIZED 

 
 

NO BID 

 
$24.50 REGULAR 

$29.99 EXTENDED 

 
 

$50.74 
Dark Navy w/gold monogramming, 
Sheriff Office logo on left breast, 
identifier on 

 
 

44 

 
 

CS419 

SS POLO SHIRT – WOMENS  
 

NO BID 

 
$52.39 REGULAR 

$53.39 OVERSIZED 

 
$34.68 REGULAR 

$39.78 OVERSIZED 
 

NO BID 

 
$24.50 REGULAR 

$29.55 EXTENDED 

 
 

$50.74 
Red w/ Black monogramming, Sheriff 
Office logo on left breast, identifier on right 
breast 

Ferro Concepts Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

45  TWOPOINT SLING – THE SLINGSTER 
NO BIDS WERE SUBMITTED BY ANY VENDOR FOR FERRO CONCEPTS ITEM 

Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
 

46 

 
 

HS370 

MESH ANSI II FLUORESCENT 
YELLOW BREAKAWAY SAFETY 
VEST W/ SHERIFF HEAT TRANSFER – 
FRONT AND BACK 

$14.81 M-XL 
$17.02 2X-4X 

 
$41.70 

$59.49 REGULAR 
$65.44 OVERSIZED 

 
NO BID 

 
$39.99 

 
$20.95 

GBRS Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

NO BIDS WERE SUBMITTED BY ANY VENDORS FOR GBRS ITEMS (47-50) 
Guardian Angel Brand Items: 

 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
Item Description  

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

 
IMPACT 

PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

 
NARDIS PUBLIC 

SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 

51 

 
 
ELT-R/B- 
IR 

 

GUARDIAN ANGEL LIGHT INFRARED 
HYBRID RED/BLUE WEARABLE 
SAFETY LIGHT $95.28 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

ꞏ 2022 Elite series 



 

 

 
 

52 

 
ACC- 
UCMS 

 

SMALL UNIVERSAL CLIP MOUNT 
 

$10.57 
 

NO BID 
 

NO BID 
 

NO BID 
 

NO BID 
 

NO BID 
 
 

53 

 
 
ACC-SCM 

STRAP/EPAULET MOUNT W/ 
MAGNETIC MOUNT 

 
$11.98 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

Herospride Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 

54 

 
EG4514 SEW ON INSIGNIA, CORPORAL  

$2.14 
*SET* 

 
$2.00 

*SINGLE* 

 
$4.76 

*SET* 

 
NO BID 

 
$3.99 

*SET* 

 
$3.00 

*SET* (Gold/Navy) (Silver/Black) 
 
 

55 

 
 
EG4514 

SEW ON INSIGNIA, SERGEANT & 
STAFF SERGEANT 
(Gold/Navy)(Silver/Black) 

 
$2.14 

*SET* 

 
$2.00 

*SINGLE* 

 
$4.76 

*SET* 

 
NO BID 

 
$3.99 

*SET* 

 
$3.00 

*SET* 

 

56 

 

EG4513 
SEW ON INSIGNIA, HASHMARKS 
(Gold/Navy) 
(Silver/Black) 

 
$1.52 

*SET* 

 
$2.00 

*SINGLE* 

 
$2.29 

*SET* 

 
NO BID 

 
$3.99 

*SET* 

$2.30 
*SET* 

Hesco Brand Items: 
 

Item 

 

Model 

 

Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. 
DBA GOT YOU 

COVERED WORK 
WEAR & UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

57 

 
 
 
3810-SH- 
MC-L 

HEAVY VEST BODY ARMOR 

800 series armor, Shooters cut 
 
NOMINAL WIDTH X LENGTH: 10.0 x 12.0 inches / 254 x 305 mm 
THICKNESS: .98 inches / 25 mm 
WEIGHT: 3.9 lb / 1.8 kg 

NO BID $1,390.92* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

  
 
 
3810-SH- 
MC-S 

HEAVY VEST BODY ARMOR 
800 series armor, Shooters cut 

 
NOMINAL WIDTH X LENGTH: 8.0 x 10.0 inches / 203 x 254 mm 
THICKNESS: .98 inches / 25 mm 
WEIGHT: 2.5 lb / 1.2 kg 

 
NO BID 

 
$1,272.12* 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

High Speed Gear Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
 

58 

 
 

41TA00BK 

DUTY TACO RIFLE POUCH  
$39.00 

 
$53.10 

 
$51.00 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
$43.00 ꞏ Black 

 
59 

 
41PT00BK 

DUTY TACO FLASHLIGHT POUCH  
$29.82 

 
$42.96 

 
$39.00 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
$34.42 (Single Pistol Taco) 

ꞏ Black 

 
 

60 

 
41RD00B 

K 

DUTY TACO RADIO POUCCH  
$42.82 

 
$57.32 

 
$56.00 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
$47.52 ꞏ Black 

 
 

61 

 
 

11TQ00BK 

TOURNIQUET POUCH  
$35.15 

 
$48.87 

 
$46.00 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
$39.84 ꞏ Black 

 
62 

 
16DC00 

POLYMER HANDCUFF TACO 
$30.58 $43.80 $41.00 NO BID NO BID $34.56 ꞏ Coyote Tan and Black option 

 
 

63 

 
HSG- 

41D002BK 

 

DUTY HANDCUFF TACO (DOUBLE) 
 

$48.11 
 

$63.24 
 

$63.00 
 

NO BID 
 

NO BID 
 

$53.40 

 



 

 

Lawpro Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
64 

 
BD249 

 
BRASS TIE BAR NO BID $2.57* $5.39 NO BID $3.99 $4.38 

 
65 

 
BD252 

 
1"CORPORAL RANK INSIGNIA PIN NO BID $4.05* $7.19 NO BID $3.75 $5.72 

 
66 

 
CB508 

 
1 "SERGEANT RANK INSIGNIA PIN NO BID $4.05* $7.19 NO BID $3.75 $5.90 

 
67 

 
CB505 

 
3/4” LIEUTENANT RANK INSIGNIA PIN NO BID $4.46* $8.09 NO BID $3.75 $5.40 

 
68 

 
BD255 

 
1" LIEUTENANT RANK INSIGNIA PIN NO BID $4.59* $8.09 NO BID $3.75 $6.50 

 
69 

 
CB503 

 
3/4” CAPTAIN RANK INSIGNIA PIN NO BID $4.59* $8.09 NO BID $3.75 $5.66 

 
70 

 
CB503 

 
1" CAPTAIN RANK INSIGNIA PIN NO BID $4.86* $8.09 NO BID $3.75 $7.50 

 
71 

 1" STAFF SERGEANT RANK INSIGNIA 
PIN (gold) 

NO BID $4.73* $8.09 NO BID $3.75 $17.85 

 
 

72 
 

5/8" ASSISTANT CHIEF INSIGNIA PIN 
(one star gold) 

 
NO BID 

 
$4.59* 

 
$8.09 

 
NO BID 

 
$3.75 

 
$6.20 

 
73 

 1" ASSISTANT CHIEF INSIGNIA PIN 
(one star gold) 

NO BID $4.59* $8.09 NO BID $3.75 $6.68 

 
74 

 
5/8" CHIEF INSIGNIA PIN (two star gold) NO BID $8.10* $12.59 NO BID $3.75 $13.72 

 
75 

 
1" CHIEF INSIGNIA PIN (two star gold) NO BID $8.10* $12.59 NO BID $3.75 $8.96 

 
76 

 
5/8" SHERIFF INSIGNIA PIN (three star 
gold) 

NO BID $8.44* $13.05 NO BID $3.75 $9.32 

77 

 
1” SHERIFF INSIGNIA PIN (three star 
gold) 

NO BID $8.44* $13.05 NO BID $3.75 $11.78 

Revision Brand Items: 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

78 
 

SAWFLY EYEWEAR APEL U.S. 
MILITTARY KIT 

$51.45 $81.67 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Safariland Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
 

79 

 
SAF-90H- 

4HS 

 
BASKET WEAVE TOP FLAP 
HIDDEN SNAP HANDCUFF POUCH 

 
NO BID 

 
$41.82 

 
$36.98 

 
NO BID 

 
$34.97 

 
$31.50 

 
 

80 

 
SAF-306-2- 

4 

 
BASKET WEAVE OPEN TOP MINI-
FLASHLIGHT HOLDER 

 
NO BID 

 
$41.08 

 
$36.13 

 
NO BID 

 
$34.15 

 
$30.58 



 

 

 
 

81 

 
SF77-83- 

4B 

 
BASKET WEAVE DOUBLE MAGAZINE 
POUCH BRASS SNAP 

 
NO BID 

 
$48.03 

 
$44.20 

 
NO BID 

 
$41.78 

 
$37.89 

82 
 

6004-8 
SMALL MOLLE ADAPTER PLATE NO BID $38.52 $33.15 NO BID $31.30 $26.47 

ꞏ Black 

 
 

83 

 
 

Liberator 

LIBERATOR IV ADVANCED SINGLE 
COMM HEADSEAT AND PTT 
SYSTEM W/ GAS MASK 
INPUT – OLIVE DRAB 

 
 

NO BID 

 
$1,894.14 

 
$969.00 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

ꞏ Boom mic for both left & right, LIB IV Adaptive suspension, XG-25 
PTT w/volume controls 

SKD Tactical Brand Items: 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
Item Description  

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

 
NARDIS PUBLIC 

SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 

84 

 

PIG.771 
PIG (FDT) COLD WEATHER GLOVE  

NO BID 
 

$26.79* 
 

NO BID 
 

NO BID 
 

NO BID 
 

NO BID ꞏ Coyote Brown and Black 

 

85 

 

PIG.700 

PIG (FDT) ALPHA GLOVE  
 

NO BID 

 
 

$33.25* 

 
 

NO BID 

 
 

NO BID 

 
 

NO BID 

 
 

NO BID 
ꞏ Black, Coyote, Carbon Grey, Ranger Green, 
Woodland, Multicam, and Multicam Black 

Spiritus Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

NO BIDS WERE SUBMITTED BY ANY VENDORS FOR SPIRITUS ITEMS (86-106) 

Steiner Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
107 9008 

DUAL BEAM AIMING LASER – 
ADVANCED 3 

ꞏ Black $1,568.20 $1,727.01 NO BID $1,518.28 NO BID NO BID 

Surefire Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description DANA SAFETY 

SUPPLY INC 
 

M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT 
PROMOTIONAL 

SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
108 

SF-G2XD- 
D-BK 

G2X PRO FLASHLIGHT $65.88 $82.76 $80.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 
 

109 

 
 
M640DFT- 
PRO 

6- VOLT DUAL FUEL HIGH-CANDELA 
SCOUT LIGHT PRO WEAPONLIGHT 

 
$266.00 

 
$319.07 

 
$399.00 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

ꞏ Black 

 
 



 

 

 
 
 

110 

 
 
 
DS-SR07- 
D-IT 

WATERPROOF SWITCH ASSEMBLY 
FOR SCOUT LIGHT WEAPONLIGHTS 
& ATPIAL/DBAL LASERS 

 
$144.94 

 
$211.72 

 
$176.00 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

ꞏ Black 

 
111 

 
X300V 

INFRARED / WHITE LED HANDGUN 
WEAPONLIGHT WITH RAILLOCK 
MOUNTING SYSTEM. 

$405.64 $432.21 $479.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

 
 

112 

 
 
DG-11 

DG SWITCHES – PRESSURE 
SWITCH FOR FLASH LIGHT 

 
$100.47 

 
$118.33 

 
$135.00 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
 

113 

 
 
Surefire 

MULTI-USE HIGH-PERFORMANCE 
LEDHELMETLIGHT 

 
$163.05 

 
$182.71 

 
$220.00 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

ꞏ White/Red 

T.Rex Brand Items: 
 

 

 
Item 

 

 

 

Model 

 

 

 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 

114 

 
 

T.Rex 

DUMP POUCH 
ꞏ Black, Coyote Brown, M81 Woodland, 
Multicam Original, 
Ranger Green, and Wolf Grey 

NO BID $59.01* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Tact Squad Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
115 

 
8000N 

 
MEN’S NAVY BLAZER $44.64 NO BID $63.71 REGULAR 

$70.08 OVERSIZED 
NO BID NO BID $59.96 

 
116 

 
8000NW 

 
WOMEN’S NAVY BLAZER $44.64 NO BID $63.71 REGULAR 

$70.08 OVERSIZED 
NO BID NO BID $59.96 

 
117 

 
7002HE MEN’S PANTS, HEATHER GRAY, 

HEMMED 
$26.81 NO BID $33.96 REGULAR 

$35.66 OVERSIZED 
NO BID NO BID $18.59 

 
118 

 
7002HEW WOMEN’S PANTS, HEATHER GRAY, 

HEMMED 
$26.81 NO BID $36.51 REGULAR 

$38.34 OVERSIZED 
NO BID NO BID $18.59 

Team Wendy Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
119 

 
EXFIL 

EXFIL Ballistic Rail 3.0 Helmet $1,330.64 $1,791.81* NO BID $1,322.22 NO BID NO BID 
ꞏ Green, Tan and Black option 

 
120 

 
EXFIL 

EXFIL Ballistic Rail 2.0 Helmet Cover $82.35 $139.79* NO BID $77.78 NO BID NO BID 
ꞏ Multicam, Green, Tan and 

Trijicon Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
 

121 

 TRIICON RED DOT MRO 2MOA w/ 
FACTORY MOUNTS 

 
$474.29 

 
$468.00 

 
NO BID 

 
$390.32 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

ꞏ Black 
 

 



 

 

Tru-Spec Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
122 

 
2448 

24-7 SERIES TACTICAL SOFTSHELL 
JACKET, BLACK, W/ DEPARTMENT 
SHOULDER PATCHES 

$71.00 $97.56 $106.21 NO BID NO BID $89.35 

 
123 

 
2449 

24-7 SERIES TACTICAL SOFTSHELL 
JACKET, NAVY, W/ DEPARTMENT 
SHOULDER PATCHES 

$71.00 
 

$97.56 $106.21 NO BID NO BID $89.35 

UF PRO Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
124 

 
UF PRO 

STRIKER XT GEN.3 COMBAT SHIRT NO BID $106.20* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
ꞏ Multicam, Green, Tan and 

 
125 

 
UF PRO 

STRIKER XT GEN.3 COMBAT PANTS NO BID $172.50* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 
ꞏ Multicam, Green, Tan and 

 
126 

 
UF PRO 

DELTA ACE PLUS GEN.2 TACTIAL 
WINTTER JACKET 

ꞏ      Multicam, Green, Tan and 

 
NO BID 

 
$155.60* 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 

 
127 

 
 

UF PRO 

DELTA EAGLE GEN.3 TACTICAL 
SOFTSHELL JACKET 

ꞏ Multicam, Green, Tan and 

 
NO BID 

 
$173.48* 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 
NO BID 

 

128 
 

UF PRO 

DELTA OL 4.0 TACTICAL WINTER 
PANTS 

NO BID $454.28* NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID 

ꞏ Multicam 

Uniform Cravats/Samuel Broome Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

 
129 5300 NAVY BLUE TIE 18' , 20" , 22" and 24" 

LENGTHS NO BID $13.71 $5.09 NO BID NO BID NO BID 

Walker’s Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 
Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

130 

 RAZOR SLIM ELECTRONIC MUFF  
 

$50.24 

 
 

$71.91 

 
 

NO BID 

 
 

NO BID 

 
 

NO BID 

 
 

NO BID 
ꞏ American Flag, Battle Brown, Coral, Coyote 
Brown, Hi-Viz Green, Leopard, Black, Carbon, 
Flat Dark Earth, Kryptek, Light 

Multicam Camo – Black, Pink 
(Accent), and Teal (Accent) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 

 

Waterbury Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

GALLS, LLC 

131 
UX243 

GLD SM 

TEXAS STATE SEAL BUTTONS W/ 
WASHERS & RINGS 

 
NO BID 

 
$1.50* 

 
$3.13 

 
NO BID 

 
$1.25 

 
$2.10 

Zero9 Holsters Brand Items: 
 
 
 
 

Item 

 
 
 
 
 
Model 

 
 
 
 
Item Description 

DANA SAFETY 
SUPPLY INC 

 
M-PAK, INC. 

IMPACT PROMOTIONAL 
SERVICES, LLC. DBA 
GOT YOU COVERED 

WORK WEAR & 
UNIFORM 

MALLORY SAFETY 
AND SUPPLY, LLC 

NARDIS PUBLIC 
SAFETY 

 
GALLS, LLC 

132 
Z9-2009- 

BLK- MLK 

 

BODY CAM CASE – WATCHGUARD $33.52 $47.05 NO BID NO BID NO BID $42.20 

AWARD TO: 
DANA SAFETY SUPPLY INC FOR ITEMS: 1, 3, 13, 14, 15, 16, 17, 46, 51, 52, 53, 58, 59, 60, 61, 62, 63, 78, 108, 109, 110, 111, 112, 113, 115, 
116, 122, 123, 130, 132  
GOT YOU COVERED WORK WEAR & UNIFORM FOR ITEMS: 2, 9, 10, 11, 38, 39, 83, 129 
MALLORY SAFETY AND SUPPLY, LLC FOR ITEMS: 4, 5, 121 
NARDIS PUBLIC SAFETY FOR ITEMS: 18, 19, 20, 21, 22, 23, 24, 25, 26, 27, 28, 29, 30, 31, 32, 33, 34, 35, 36, 37, 40, 41, 42, 43, 44, 54, 55, 56, 
64, 65, 66, 67, 68, 69, 70, 71, 72, 73, 74, 75, 76, 77, 131 
GALLS, LLC FOR ITEMS: 7, 8, 12, 79, 80, 81, 82, 117, 118 
 
FOLLOWING ITEMS RECEIVED NO BIDS: 
ITEM 45 – FERRO CONCEPTS BRAND ITEM 
ITEMS 47-50 – GBRS BRAND ITEMS 
ITEMS 86-106 – SPIRITUS BRAND ITEMS 
 
FOLLOWING ITEMS NOT TO BE AWARDED DUE TO PRICING: 
ITEM 107, 119, 120 
 
NOTES: 

*M-PAK, INC SUBMITTED ALTERNATE ITEMS THAT DO NOT MEET SPECIFICATIONS: 26, 27, 28, 31, 36, 37, 38, 39, 57, 64, 84, 85, 114, 124, 
125, 126, 127, 128 
**SINGLE VENDOR FOR BLAUER ITEMS FOR UNIFORMITY (18-37) 
***TO BE PURCHASED WITH BLAUER PACKAGE (54-56) 

 
 
 
 
 
 


